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F. RUDZICZ, J. POLGAR. An online resource for caregivers of persons with dementia. 
Gerontechnology 2016;15(suppl):138s; doi:10.4017/gt.2016.15.s.831.00  Purpose  There are 
many products that can help support an older adult with dementia to live in the community. It 
is often up to family caregivers to find products that will be useful, but locating these can be 
difficult, frustrating, and often futile, as family caregivers may not know what they are looking 
for or how to find it1,2. The goal of this project is to apply a new type of artificial intelligence 
called ‘cognitive computing’ to create an online tool that connects family caregivers to prod-
ucts, services and strategies they need to support themselves and an older adult with demen-
tia. The resource will use ‘natural language’ (written and spoken) as the means by which users 
can input data to initiate and refine a search for strategies, technology and/or resources.  
Method  A participatory approach3 is used to develop this online resource, involving collabora-
tion among cognitive scientists, occupational therapists, rehabilitation engineers, target users 
and health care professionals. The project involves an iterative process that moves among 
initial definition of the online resource from engineering and clinical perspectives, conduct of 
focus groups with intended users and healthcare professionals to identify user needs, techno-
logical development, to ensure that technological development is informed by user needs, 
preferences and evaluation4. An initial search was conducted to identify similar online re-
sources, using common search engines and known resources in the assistive technology field. 
Results of existing resources and a literature review informed the development of initial focus 
group guides. Six focus groups are planned: 4 involving intended users, and 2 with healthcare 
professionals (n=48; 18 years and older, gender proportion not available). Participants will be 
asked to describe their needs for information, their preferred method of seeking and receiving 
information and their preference for visual display of information.  Results & Discussion  Re-
view of existing resources found no existing products that used cognitive computing technolo-
gy or that had the planned scope and possible depth of information that will be made available 
via the planned online resource. Results from the focus groups will allow us to prioritize infor-
mation to be included in the searchable database and to develop preliminary design criteria for 
the first product version. Use of a participatory approach to the project is intended to maximize 
the likelihood that the resulting product is useful and usable by family caregivers supporting an 
individual with dementia.  
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